Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 51, No. 11—26th January, 2012 49

LEcAL NoTIicE No. 12

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO
THE PIiLOTAGE Act, CHAP. 51:02
BYE-LAWS

MADE BY THE PILOTAGE AUTHORITY WITH THE APPROVAL OF THE
MINISTER UNDER SECTION 7 OF THE PILOTAGE ACT

THE PILOTAGE (AMENDMENT) BYE-LAWS, 2012

1. These Bye-laws may be cited as the Pilotage (Amendment) citation
Bye-laws, 2012.

2. In these Bye-laws, “the Bye-laws” means the Pilotage Bye-laws. Interpretation

3. Clause 17 of the Bye-laws is amended in— Clause 17
amended

(a) paragraph (a), by inserting the words “and Tembladora”
immediately after the word “Chaguaramas”, and by
deleting the words “$125.00” and substituting the words
“$175.007;

(b) paragraph (b), by deleting the words “$190.00” and
substituting the words “$300.00”;

(c) paragraph (c), by deleting the words “$190.00” and
substituting the words “$300.00”;

(d) paragraph (d), by deleting the words “$190.00” and
substituting the words “$300.00”;

(e) paragraph (e), by deleting the words “$325.00” and
substituting the words “$300.00”; and

(f) paragraph (f), by deleting the words “$375.00” and
substituting the words “$300.00”.

4. Clause 32(1) of the Bye-laws is amended in— Clause 32

mended
(a) subparagraph (a)i), by deleting the words “$900.00” anda1 e
substituting the words “$1,700.00”; and
(b) subparagraph (a)ii), by deleting the words “$1,700.00” and
substituting the words “$2,000.00”.



50 Pilotage (Amendment) Bye-Laws, 2012
First 5. The First Schedule of the Bye-laws is repealed and the following
Sﬁ;’:ﬁﬁie 4 Schedule is substituted:

“FIRST SCHEDULE
(Clauses 14 and 33)

Description of ship Dues payable in or out of any
compulsory pilotage area

Ships up to 2,500 tons $950.00

Tankers $950.00 plus an additional charge of
30 cents per ton for each ton in excess
of 2,500 gross tonnage

Container ships and passenger ships $950.00 plus an additional charge of
17 cents per ton for each ton in excess
of 2,500 gross tonnage

Other ships up to 15,000 gross tonnage $950.00 plus an additional charge of
17 cents per ton for each ton in excess
of 2,500 gross tonnage

Other ships in excess of 15,000 gross $950.00 plus an additional charge of

tonnage 30 cents per ton for each ton in excess
of 2,500 gross tonnage.”.

Made by the Pilotage Authority this 20th day of January, 2012.

B. PHILLIP
Chairman
Pilotage Authority

Approved by the Minister this 20th day of January, 2012.

D. MAHARAJ
Minister of Transport

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN
RepuBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2012



