
LEGAL NOTICE NO. 155

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO

THE CENTRAL TENDERS BOARD ACT, CHAP. 71:91

REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE PRESIDENT UNDER SECTION 35 OF THE CENTRAL
TENDERS BOARD ACT

THE CENTRAL TENDERS BOARD (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS, 2009

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Central Tenders Board
(Amendment) Regulations, 2009.

2. In these Regulations “the Regulations” means the
Central Tenders Board Regulations.

3. Regulation 11 of the Regulations is amended in subregulation (2)
by deleting the words “one million dollars” wherever they occur and
substituting the words “two million dollars”.

4. Regulation 12 of the Regulations is amended in—
(a) subregulation (1)(a), by deleting the words “five hundred

thousand dollars” and substituting the words “one million
dollars”;

(b) subregulation (2)—
(i) in paragraph (a) by deleting the words “fifty thousand
dollars” and substituting the words “one hundred
thousand dollars”; and

(ii) in paragraph (b), by deleting the words “one hundred
thousand dollars” and substituting the words “two
hundred thousand dollars”; and

(c) subregulation (3) in paragraph (a) by deleting the words
“five hundred thousand dollars” and substituting the words
“one million dollars”.

Dated this 27th day of August, 2009.

A. LEUNG WOO-GABRIEL
Secretary to Cabinet

Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 48, No. 98—27th August, 2009 865

Citation

Regulation 12
amended

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2009

Interpretation

No. 137 of 1965

Regulation 11
amended


