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SUPPLEMENT TO THIS ISSUE

THE DOCUMENT detailed hereunder has been issued and is published as a Supplement to this issue of the Trinidad and Tobago Gazette:

Legal Supplement Part B—T

Elections and Boundaries Commission (Local Government and Tobago House of Assembly) Order, 2009—(Legal Notice No. 129 of
2009).

——————————————————————————————————————————————————————————————–
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GRANT OF CERTIFICATES OF REGISTRATION
(Citizenship of the Republic of Trinidad and Tobago Act, 1976)

Number Name Date

12626 … RACHEL GOLENA ANELTHA MILLINGTON … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 15304)

D. BASCOMBE
Acting Permanent Secretary,

Ministry of National Security

–————————————————————————————————
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Number Name Date

12628 … SONIA RAMPERSAD … … … … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 15229)

12629 … KENROY ARRINTON SEATON ... ... … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 15082)

12630 … LENNOX EMANUEL TROTMAN … … … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 15204)

12631 … SHARON RANDA STEWART … … … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 14728)

12633 … DOREEN PAMELA HAMILTON … … … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 15205)

12634 … BERNADETTE BOTAS … … … ... 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 15230)

12635 … BIBI NAZEEMA KHAN … ... ... … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 15174)

12636 … MOHAMED ACKBAR KHAN ... … … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 15175)

12647 … RONALD SEWNAUTH … ... … … 21st May, 2009—(NS: 19/2/1 S. 14047)

J. BOUCAUD-BLAKE
Permanent Secretary,

Ministry of National Security
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NOTICE OF INTENDED REMOVAL OF DEFUNCT
COMPANIES FROM REGISTER

[Section 461(3) of the Companies Act, 1995]

NOTICE is hereby given that at the expiration of three months
from the date of this notice the names of the Companies
appearing hereunder will, unless cause is shown to the
contrary, be struck off the Register of Companies kept at this
office, and the Companies will be dissolved:

Name of Companies

JIM ENTERPRISES LIMITED—J 1335 (95)

THE CUT SHOP LIMITED—T 4310 (95)

SEEBROS LIMITED—S 5382 (95)

ANDY AND ANTON NOREIGA CONTRACTORS

LTD.—A 5548 (95)

Dated this 5th day of February, 2009 at the Registrar
General’s Office.

A. J. VALÉRE
Registrar of Companies

—————————————————————————————–
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LOSS OF GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN
LIMITED POLICIES

SWORN declaration having been made that Policy Number
5000058666 issued by GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN LIMITED

on the life of SANGEETA SAMLAL has been lost, and having
made application to the Company for a duplicate policy, notice
is hereby given that unless objection is raised within one month
of the undermentioned date, the duplicate policy requested will
be issued.

GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN

LIMITED

1, Guardian Drive
Westmoorings South-East.

3rd June, 2009.

——————————————————
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SWORN declaration having been made that Policy Number
8000099187 issued by GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN LIMITED

on the life of SANGEETA SAMLAL has been lost, and having
made application to the Company for a duplicate policy, notice
is hereby given that unless objection is raised within one month
of the undermentioned date, the duplicate policy requested will
be issued.

GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN

LIMITED

1, Guardian Drive
Westmoorings South-East.

3rd June, 2009.
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SWORN declaration having been made that Policy Number
8000159376 issued by GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN LIMITED

on the life of ROXANNE MANUEL has been lost, and having
made application to the Company for a duplicate policy, notice
is hereby given that unless objection is raised within one month
of the undermentioned date, the duplicate policy requested will
be issued.

GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN

LIMITED

1, Guardian Drive
Westmoorings South-East.

3rd June, 2009.

——————————————————
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SWORN declaration having been made that Policy Number
8000223503 issued by GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN LIMITED

on the life of EVELYN HOLDER-CARTER has been lost, and
having made application to the Company for a duplicate policy,
notice is hereby given that unless objection is raised within one
month of the undermentioned date, the duplicate policy
requested will be issued.

GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN

LIMITED

1, Guardian Drive
Westmoorings South-East.

3rd June, 2009.

——————————————————
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SWORN declaration having been made that Policy Number
8000258081 issued by GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN LIMITED

on the life of KRISHNA RAMLOCHAN has been lost, and
having made application to the Company for a duplicate policy,
notice is hereby given that unless objection is raised within one
month of the undermentioned date, the duplicate policy
requested will be issued.

GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN

LIMITED

1, Guardian Drive
Westmoorings South-East.

3rd June, 2009.

——————————————————
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SWORN declaration having been made that Policy Number
8000439492 issued by GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN LIMITED

on the life of TERRANCE ALEXANDER has been lost, and
having made application to the Company for a duplicate policy,
notice is hereby given that unless objection is raised within one
month of the undermentioned date, the duplicate policy
requested will be issued.

GUARDIAN LIFE OF THE CARIBBEAN

LIMITED

1, Guardian Drive
Westmoorings South-East.

3rd June, 2009.


