Legal Supplement Part B—Vol. 51, No. 34—5th March, 2012 143

LEgaL NoticE No. 35
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO
THE PETROLEUM AcT, CHAP. 62:01
REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE PRESIDENT UNDER SECTION 29 OF THE PETROLEUM ACT
AND SUBJECT TO NEGATIVE RESOLUTION OF PARLIAMENT

THE PETROLEUM (COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2012

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Petroleum (Compressed Citation
Natural Gas) (Amendment) Regulations, 2012.

2. The Petroleum (Compressed Natural Gas) Regulations are regulation 8

amended in regulation 8(2)— ?}EZ?SS;M

(a) in paragraphs (a) and (b), by deleting the words “$1,000.00”
and substituting the words “$2,000.00”; and

(b)in paragraph (c), by deleting the words “$5,000.00” and
substituting the words “$10,000.00”.

Dated this 5th day of March, 2012.

M. SINGH-MARAJ
Acting Secretary to Cabinet

Laid in the House of Representatives this day of ,2012.
Clerk of the House
Laid in the Senate this day of , 2012.
Clerk of the Senate

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN
RepuBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2012



