
LEGAL NOTICE NO. 289

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO

THE CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES ACT, CHAP. 81:03

REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE MINISTER OF LABOUR AND SMALL ENTERPRISE
DEVELOPMENT UNDER SECTION 81 OF THE CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES ACT

THE  CO-OPERATIVE  SOCIETIES  (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS,  2020

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Co-operative Societies
(Amendment) Regulations, 2020.

2. In these Regulations, “the Regulations” means the Co-operative
Societies Regulations.

3. The Regulations are amended in regulation 18–

(a) in subregulation (1), by deleting the words “one month” and
substituting the words “three months”; and

(b) by inserting after subregulation (1), the following
subregulation:

“(1A). Any extension of time necessary for the holding of
the Annual General Meeting or any change to the mode 
of the meeting shall be determined only where the
Commissioner so authorises.”.

4. The Regulations are amended in regulation 24 by deleting 
the full stop and inserting the words “, the mode of these elections and
the procedures to be adopted shall be determined only where the
Commissioner so authorises.”.

5. The Regulations are amended in regulation 48(1) by deleting the
words “two months” and substituting the words “four months”.

Dated this 7th day of August, 2020.

J.  BAPTISTE  PRIMUS
Minister of Labour and

Small Enterprise Development 

Legal Supplement Part B–Vol. 59, No. 143–16th August, 2020 1159

Citation

Interpretation
Chap. 81:03

Regulation 18
amended

Regulation 24
amended

Regulation 48(1)
amended

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, CARONI
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO–2020


