
LEGAL NOTICE NO. 280

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO

THE CONSERVATION OF WILD LIFE ACT, CHAP. 67:01

REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE MINISTER UNDER SECTION 24(1) OF THE CONSERVATION

OF WILD LIFE ACT

THE  CONSERVATION  OF  WILD  LIFE  (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS,  2019

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Conservation of Wild Life
(Amendment) Regulations, 2019.

2. In these Regulations, “the Regulations” means the Conservation
of Wild Life Regulations.

3. The Act is amended–

(a) in Part II of the Second Schedule by deleting the following:

“Herons: Great blue heron (Adrea herodias), Cocoi heron
(Adrea cocoi), Black-crowned night heron (Nycticorax 
nycticorax), Yellow-crowned night heron (Nyctanassa 
violacea), Boat-billed heron (Cochlearius)

Neotropic Cormorant (Phalacrocorax brasilianus)

Rallidae: All birds belonging to the Family Rallidae (Coots,
Rails, Gallinules and their allies)

Wild Ducks: Black-bellied whistling duck (Dendrocygna 
autumnalis), Fulvous whistling duck (Dendrocygna bicolor),
Muscovy (Cairina moschata).”; and

(b) in the Third Schedule by adding the following:

“Capybara (Hydrochoerus hydrochaeris)”.

4. Regulation 2 of the Regulations is amended in subregulation (4),
by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and substituting the 
words “five thousand dollars or two thousand five hundred dollars, 
respectively.”.

5. Regulation 4 of the Regulations is amended in subregulation (4),
by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and substituting the words
“two thousand dollars”.

Legal Supplement Part B–Vol. 58, No. 125–11th September, 2019 587

Citation

Interpretation
Chap. 67:01

Second and
Third 
Schedules to
the Act
amended

Regulation 2
amended

Regulation 4
amended



Regulation 4A
amended

Regulation 5
amended

Regulation 6
amended

Regulation 7
amended

6. Regulation 4A of the Regulations is amended in subregulation (2),
by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and substituting the words
“two thousand dollars”.

7. Regulation 5 of the Regulations is amended in subregulation (2),
by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and substituting the words
“two thousand, five hundred dollars”.

8. Regulation 6 of the Regulations is amended–

(a) in subregulation (1), by inserting after the word “sell”, the
words “,offer, advertise for sale”;

(b) in subregulation (1A), by inserting after the word “sell”, the
words “,offer, advertise for sale”;

(c) by inserting after subregulation (1B), the following sub-
regulation:

“ (1C) In addition to the prohibitions set out in sub-
regulation (1), no person shall have in his possession, serve,
purchase, sell, offer, advertise for sale or expose for sale from
1st January to 31st March annually, any iguana which fall
under the category of lizards referred to in Part I of the 
Second Schedule to the Act.”; and

(d) in subregulation (2)–

(i) by deleting the words “or (1A)” and substituting the
words “, (1A) or (1C)”; and

(ii) by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and 
substituting the words “ten thousand dollars”;

9. Regulation 7 of the Regulations is amended–

(a) in subregulation (1), by deleting the word “No” and 
substituting the words “Subject to subregulation (1A), no”;

(b) by inserting after subregulation (1), the following sub-
regulation:

“ (1A) Where the animal referred to in the Second Schedule
to the Act is a lizard,  no person shall hunt or be a member
of a party engaged in hunting lizards in any Forest Reserve
at any time, within the municipal boundaries of the city of
Port-of-Spain.”; and

(c) in subregulation (2)–

(i) by inserting after the words “(1)”, the words “or (1A)”;
and

(ii) by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and 
substituting the words “five thousand dollars”.

588 Conservation of Wild Life (Amendment) Regulations, 2019



10. The Regulations is amended by inserting after regulation 7, the
following regulation:

“7A. (1) No person shall hunt or be a member of 
a party engaged in hunting lizards, an animal 
referred to in the Second Schedule to the Act, on any
State Lands at any time, within the municipal
boundaries of the city of Port-of-Spain. 

(2) Any person who contravenes the provision
of subregulation (1) is liable on summary conviction
to a fine of five thousand dollars.

(3) The power of the Chief Game Warden 
to authorise hunting of lizards within the municipal
boundaries of the city of Port-of-Spain under 
section 6 of the Act is hereby suspended.”.

11. Regulation 8 of the Regulations is deleted.

12. Regulation 9 of the Regulations is amended in subregulation (2),
by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and substituting the words
“five thousand dollars”.

13. Regulation 10 of the Regulations is amended in subregulation (2),
by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and substituting the words
“five thousand dollars”.

14. Regulation 14 of the Regulations is amended in subregulation (2),
by deleting the words “two hundred dollars” and substituting the words
“one thousand dollars”.

Dated this 9th day of September, 2019.

C.  RAMBHARAT
Minister of Agriculture, Land

and Fisheries

Conservation of Wild Life (Amendment) Regulations, 2019 589

Regulation 7A
inserted

Regulation 8
deleted
Regulation 9
amended

Regulation 10
amended

Regulation 14
amended

Hunting on
State Lands 
Second Schedule

Chap. 67:01

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, CARONI

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO–2019


