
LEGAL NOTICE NO. 69

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO

THE MOTOR VEHICLES AND ROAD TRAFFIC ACT, CHAP. 48:50

ORDER

MADE BY THE MINISTER OF WORKS AND INFRASTRUCTURE UNDER

SECTION 65 OF THE MOTOR VEHICLES AND ROAD TRAFFIC ACT

THE MISCELLANEOUS ROAD TRAFFIC (AMENDMENT)
ORDER, 2013

1. This Order may be cited as the Miscellaneous Road Traffic
(Amendment) Order, 2013.

2. The Orders specified in the first column of the Schedule are
amended in the manner specified in the second column of that
Schedule.

SCHEDULE

Order Amendment

Legal Supplement Part B–Vol. 52, No. 67–16th May, 2013 329

Citation

Orders
amended

The Road Traffic
(Prohibited Parking)
Order
Chap. 48:50

Clause 3 Deleting the words “five hundred dollars” and substituting
the words “three thousand dollars”.

First Schedule

Part F Inserting after item 7, the following items:

“ 8. Evans Street, between St. Augustine Circular
Road and Alice Street.

9. Southern Main Road, Curepe, between Priority
Bus Route and Churchill-Roosevelt Highway.”.

Part G Inserting after item 44, the following item:

“ 45. Western Main Road, between the entrance to
Alcoa Steamship Company Incorporated and the
entrance to the Cove.”.



Second Schedule Inserting in the appropriate alphabetical sequence, the
following:

“COUNTY OF ST. GEORGE EAST

330 Miscellaneous Road Traffic (Amendment) Order, 2013

1. Valsayn No. 1 Trace–
western and eastern
sides

Monday to Friday between
2.00 p.m. and 4.00 p.m.
Public holidays not
included

2. Watts Street Monday to Friday between
6.00 a.m. and 6.00 p.m.
Public holidays not
included

3. Belle Smythe Street,
between Harris
Street and Evans
Street

Monday to Friday between
6.00 a.m. and 9.00 a.m.
and between 3.00 p.m.
and 6.00 p.m. Public
holidays not included

4. Lyndon Street,
between Rapsey
Street and Southern
Main Road

Monday to Friday between
6.00 a.m. and 9.00 a.m.
and between 3.00 p.m.
and 6.00 p.m. Public
holidays not included”.

The Miscellaneous Roads
(Unilateral Parking)
Order
Chap. 48:50

Clause 3 Deleting the words “five hundred dollars” and substituting
the words “three thousand dollars”.

Schedule

Part F Inserting after item 3, the following item:

“Road Side of Road

4. Belle Smythe Street,
between Agostini
Street and Bushe
Street

Eastern
Monday to Friday between
6.00 a.m. and 4.00 p.m.
Public holidays not
included”.

Order Amendment

The Road Traffic
(Prohibited Parking)
Order
Chap. 48:50–
Continued



Dated this 6th day of May, 2013.

S. RAMBACHAN
Minister of Works and Infrastructure

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO–2013

Miscellaneous Road Traffic (Amendment) Order, 2013 331

The Miscellaneous Roads
(Unilateral Alternate
Parking) Order
Chap. 48:50

Clause 4 Deleting the words “five hundred dollars” and substituting
the words “three thousand dollars”.

Schedule

Part F Deleting item 2–

“Road Side of Road Day of Week and
Time where
Applicable

2. S o u t h e r n
Main Road,
Curepe in the
Ward of
St. Ann’s }

Eastern

Western

Tuesday, Thursday,
Saturday

Order Amendment

Inserting after item 21, the following items:

“Road Side of Road Day of Week and
Time where
Applicable

22. That portion
of Belle
S m y t h e
S t r e e t ,
b e t w e e n
Bushe Street
and Watts
Street

Eastern

Western

Monday, Wednesday,
Friday”.

Monday, Wednesday,
Friday

Tuesday, Thursday,
Saturday
Public holidays
not included

23. R a p s e y
Street

Northern

Southern

Monday, Wednesday,
Friday

Tuesday, Thursday,
Saturday
Public holidays
not included.”.

}
}


