
LEGAL NOTICE NO. 234

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO

THE CENTRAL TENDERS BOARD ACT, CHAP. 71:91

REGULATIONS

MADE BY THE PRESIDENT UNDER SECTION 35 OF THE CENTRAL TENDERS
BOARD ACT

THE CENTRAL TENDERS BOARD (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS, 2011

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Central Tenders Board
(Amendment) Regulations, 2011.

2. The Central Tenders Board Regulations are amended in
regulation 12(2)–

(a) in paragraph (a), by deleting the words “one hundred
thousand dollars” and substituting the words “three
hundred thousand dollars”; and

(b) in paragraph (b), by deleting the words “two hundred
thousand dollars” and substituting the words “five hundred
thousand dollars”.

Dated this 21st day of November, 2011.

A. LEUNG WOO-GABRIEL
Secretary to Cabinet

Legal Supplement Part B–Vol. 50, No. 160–24th November, 2011 675

Citation

Regulation 12
amended

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, PORT-OF-SPAIN
REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO–2011


